

<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts Recap</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>BALLAST</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	Bid All Items	No Bid 8 Items	No bid 1 item.	No Bid 17 items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 3 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>\$18,064.69</b>	<b>\$14,969.01</b>	<b>\$14,819.48</b>	<b>\$12,089.59</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$29,325.69</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts BATTERY</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	No Bid 3 Items	No Bid 1 Item	No Bid 9 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$4,876.79</b>	<b>\$5,379.60</b>	<b>\$5,708.10</b>	<b>\$7,942.29</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts BOX</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	Bid All Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$63.89</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$83.25</b>	<b>\$112.38</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts BULB</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid 3 Items	No Bid 79 Items	No Bid 4 Items	No Bid 40 Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 12 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>\$11,870.56</b>	<b>\$6,488.72</b>	<b>\$11,537.33</b>	<b>\$13,210.74</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$22,045.51</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts COILS</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$237.00</b>	<b>\$457.89</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts CONDUIT</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>NOTES</b>	No Bid	Bid All Items	No Bid	Bid All Items	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$897.99</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$1,085.17</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$1,206.00</b>	<b>\$1,196.75</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts DEVICES</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>NOTES</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 17 Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 9 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$2,637.69</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$2,645.22</b>

<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>DRYERS</b>								
<b>NOTES</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 3 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$1,953.11</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>EXIT</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 3 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$172.62</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>FITTINGS/NUTS</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$718.54</b>	<b>\$660.04</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>MISCELLANEOUS</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 26 Items	No Bid 13 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$1,923.35</b>	<b>\$2,412.41</b>

<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>PHOTOCELL</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	Bid All Items	No Bid	No Bid 1 Item	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 Item	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$229.39</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$237.61</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$234.75</b>	<b>\$379.38</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>PLATES</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 11 Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 Item	No Bid 1 Item
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$469.65</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$273.69</b>	<b>\$432.58</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>SOCKETS</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 2 Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 Item
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$50.12</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$274.92</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>SOUND</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
<b>BID B16-03, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>SUPPLIES</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 9 Items	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid 1 Item	No Bid 4 Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$25.25</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$490.80</b>	<b>\$265.84</b>
<b>BID B15-04, Electrical Parts</b>	<b>E. Sam Jones</b>	<b>City Electric Supply</b>	<b>Voss Lighting</b>	<b>Englewood</b>	<b>Interstate Battery</b>	<b>Batteries &amp; Bulbs</b>	<b>All Metro</b>	<b>City Plumbing &amp; Electric</b>
<b>WIRE/WIREMOLD</b>								
<b>Notes</b>	No Bid	No Bid 26 Items	No Bid	No Bid 10 Items	No Bid	No Bid	Bid All Items	Bid All Items
<b>Group Total Cost</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$5,409.98</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$2,885.99</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$3,946.31</b>	<b>\$7,186.91</b>