

NO.	Item/Description	Unit of Issue	Vendor	Make/Model Bid or "As Specified"	Delivery ARO	Unit Price
100	BACK BRACE – MEDIUM ADJUSTABLE SIZE W/VELCRO ATTACHMENTS & SUSPENDER STRAPS, (Equal to Occunomix 626)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	CORDOVA #SB-MD	10-14 DAYS	\$5.76
101	BACK BRACE – LARGE ADJUSTABLE SIZE W/VELCRO ATTACHMENTS & SUSPENDER STRAPS, (Equal to Occunomix 626)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	CORDOVA #SB-LG	10-14 DAYS	\$5.76
102	BACK BRACE – XL ADJUSTABLE SIZE W/VELCRO ATTACHMENTS & SUSPENDER STRAPS, (Equal to Occunomix 626)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	CORDOVA #SB-XL	10-14 DAYS	\$5.76
103	BACK BRACE – 2XL ADJUSTABLE SIZE W/VELCRO ATTACHMENTS & SUSPENDER STRAPS,(Equal to Occunomix 626)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	CORDOVA #SB-2XL	10-14 DAYS	\$5.76
110	BROOM, ANGLE NYLON – HEAVY DUTY	EACH	Athens Janitor	Better Brush 43721	7-12 days	\$3.45
111	BROOM, CORN HEAVY DUTY (Warehouse)	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte BR-40932	7-12 days	\$4.80
112	BROOM, PUSH 24" MED. BRISTLE	EACH	Athens Janitor	Better Brush 100324	7-12 days	\$5.30
113	BROOM, PUSH 36" MED. BRISTLE	EACH	Genesis II	Better Brush 100336, 12/cs.	7 days	\$10.74
114	PUSH BROOM HANDLE, W/METAL THREADS	EACH	Pyramid School Products	ABCO #01104 (12 EA/CTN)	10-14 DAYS	\$1.84

115	CART, JANITORIAL (RUBBERMAID #6173-88) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	AS SPECIFIED	10-14 DAYS	\$104.95
119	DOODLE PAD HOLDER W/SWIVEL THREADED HANDLE RECEPTACLE	EACH	Pyramid School Products	TOLCO #280157 (12 EA/CTN)	10-14 DAYS	\$3.47
120	DOOR STOP, RUBBER WEDGE	Each	Grainger	1XNN8 BATTALION	2-3 days	\$2.40
121	DUST MOP FRAME – 24”	EACH	AVM Enterprises	bh-24524- ABCO DZ	Weekly	\$1.62
122	DUST MOP FRAME – 36”	EACH	AVM Enterprises	bh-24536- ABCO DZ	Weekly	\$2.08
123	DUST MOP FRAME – 48”	EACH	AVM Enterprises	bh-24548- ABCO DZ	Weekly	\$2.84
124	DUST MOP HANDLE (To fit Metal 24”, 36” and 48” frame)	EACH	AVM Enterprises	01406-nb- ABCO DZ	Weekly	\$4.01
125	LOBBY DUST PAN, (RUBBERMAID 2531) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	AS SPECIFIED (6 EA/CTN)	10-14 DAYS	\$6.45
127	FEATHER DUSTER, 30”	EACH	Grainger	1MYG7 TOUGH GUY	2-3 days	\$7.99
128	DOOR MAT - NOTRAX WAYFARER Vinyl-Loop Un-Backed 4' X 6' – With Border NAVY BLUE	EACH	Grainger	4CKN2 NOTRX	2-3 days	\$104.40
129	DOOR MAT- ANDERSON WATERHOG 200/161 4' X 6' NAVY BLUE WITH EDGING	EACH	Athens Janitor	Andersen Waterhog #46161	7-12 days	\$72.98

130	MOP BUCKET, WAVEBRAKE COMBO UNIT W/ SIDEPRESS WRINGER, 35 QT COMBO (RUBBERMAID 7580-88) YELLOW (No Substitutions)	EACH	Interline Brands	Rubbermaid-RCP758088YL	Next Day	\$49.95
131	WET MOP HANDLE, ORANGE W/SPEED CHANGE STIRRUP "IMPACT # 84" (No substitutions)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	AS SPECIFIED (12/CS)	10-14 DAYS	\$8.69
132	MOP HANDLE, (WOODEN HANDLE W/METAL HEAD AND BUTTERFLY NUT TO TIGHTEN CLAMP)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	ABCO #01204NB (12 EA/CTN)	10-14 DAYS	\$4.23
136	SAFETY GLASSES, CLEAR, SCRATCH RESISTANT EQUAL TO GRAINGER #4VCK2	EACH	Grainger	4VCK2 EXACT	2-3 days	\$1.21
137	SAFETY SHOE – SMALL,(Slip over the shoe) Equal to Gator Brand)	PR	Buckeye	ETC 9301	5-10 Days	\$19.50
138	SAFETY SHOE – MED.,(Slip over the shoe) Equal to Gator Brand	PR	Buckeye	ETC 9302	5-10 Days	\$19.50
139	SAFETY SHOE – LRG.,(Slip over the shoe) Equal to Gator Brand	PR	Buckeye	ETC9303	5-10 Days	\$19.50
140	SAFETY SHOE – X-LRG.,(Slip over the shoe) Equal to Gator Brand	PR	Buckeye	ETC 9304	5-10 Days	\$19.50
141	SANISAC BAG DISPENSER- Stainless Steel (BOBRICK #B-270) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Veritiv	BOBRICK B-270	12-14 ARO	\$21.97
142	SAFETY SCRAPER, EQUAL TO UNGER #SR50	EACH	Pyramid School Products	TOLCO #280114 (50 EA/CTN)	10-14 DAYS	\$1.07
146	FLOOR SQUEEGEE, 24" HEAVY DUTY W/ROUND 6' WOOD HANDLE	EACH	Athens Janitor	Better Brush #270124	7-12 days	\$8.95

149	TOILET BOWL MOP W/COTTON HEAD	EACH	Non Award	Non Award	Non Award	Non Award
150	TOILET PAPER TWIN DISPENSER FOR 9" JUMBO ROLL VISTA #59209 (No Substitutions)	EACH	Veritiv	GP 59209	10-12 ARO	\$15.05
151	TOILET PLUNGER (Deluxe Professional Force Cup, Impact #9205) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Pyramid School Products	AS SPECIFIED (12/CS)	10-14 DAYS	\$6.96
152	TRASH CAN 28 QT (RUBBERMAID #2956 -BLACK) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Calico Industries	Rubbermaid 2956	7-10 Day Aro	\$3.74
153	TRASH CAN 32 GL (RUBBERMAID #2632-56 GRAY) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Calico Industries	Rubbermaid 2632	7-10 Day Aro	\$20.94
154	TRASH CAN 44 GL (RUBBERMAID #2643 - GRAY) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Calico Industries	Rubbermaid 2643	7-10 Day Aro	\$30.74
155	TRASH CAN DOLLY (RUBBERMAID #2640-16 GRAY) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Veritiv	RM 2640 2/CS F/CS	12-14 ARO	\$19.62
156	TRASH CAN DOME LID, 44 GAL. (RUBBERMAID #2647-88 GRAY) (No Substitutions)	EACH	Veritiv	RM 2647 88	12-14 ARO	\$47.69
160	WET FLOOR CONE, ORANGE 18" HIGH (continental 125 ENG/SP 21500596) Or Approved Equal	EACH	Grainger	6FHC8	2-3 days	\$6.42
163	Long Handle Scraper Equal To Unger #LH12C	EACH	AVM Enterprises	ct08010-ABCO DZ	Weekly	\$6.91

164	General Purpose Extension Cord 50' 16Gauge, Power Indicator, 13 Amps (Equal To Grainger #1FD53)	EACH	Grainger	1FD53 EXACT	2-3 days	\$13.24
165	13" Disk Brush Poly Tomcat #13-421P (No Substitutions)	EACH	Athens Janitor	TomCat #13-421P	7-12 days	\$45.75
300	Cardboard Box , Brown, Small 18x12x12	25/CASE	Grainger	11A762	2-3 days	\$42.50
301	Cardboard Box , Brown, Medium 18x18x16	25/CASE	Grainger	111A776 EXACT	2-3 days	\$61.50
302	Cardboard Box , Brown, Large 24.5x19.5x19.75	25/CASE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
303	FLOOR STRIPPING PAD 12" BLACK, 3M 7200 or equivalent ETC model only.	20/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 10121	7-12 days	\$25.85
304	FLOOR CLEANING PAD 12" RED, 3M 5100 or equivalent ETC model only.	20/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 70121	7-12 days	\$25.85
305	FLOOR BUFFING PAD 12" WHITE, 3m4100 or equivalent ETC model only.	20/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 80201	7-12 days	\$25.85
306	FLOOR STRIPPING PAD 13" BLACK, 3M 7200 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 10131	7-12 days	\$7.46
307	FLOOR CLEANING PAD 13" RED, 3M 5100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 70130	7-12 days	\$7.46

308	FLOOR BUFFING PAD 13" WHITE, 3m4100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 80205	7-12 days	\$7.46
309	FLOOR STRIPPING PAD 14" BLACK, 3M 7200 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 10141	7-12 days	\$8.40
310	FLOOR CLEANING PAD 14" RED, 3M 5100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 70140	7-12 days	\$8.40
311	FLOOR BUFFING PAD 14" WHITE, 3M 4100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 80170	7-12 days	\$8.40
315	FLOOR BUFFING PAD 20" NATURAL BLEND, 3M 3300 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 20069	7-12 days	\$12.70
316	FLOOR STRIPPING PAD 20" BLACK, 3M 7200 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 10205	7-12 days	\$14.56
317	FLOOR CLEANING PAD 20" RED, 3M 5100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 70200	7-12 days	\$14.56
318	FLOOR BUFFING PAD 20" WHITE, 3M 4100 or equivalent ETC model only.	5/CASE	Athens Janitor	ETC 80201	7-12 days	\$14.56
325	DUST MASK, DISPOSABLE	50/BOX	Pyramid School Products	IMPACT #7300B	10-14 DAYS	\$4.89
326	DUST MOP PAD 24" x 5" Washable Hospital Grade, Blue 4-ply yarn	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte DM-81524	7-12 days	\$4.78

327	DUST MOP PAD 36" x 5" Washable Hospital Grade, Blue 4-ply yarn	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte DM- 81536	7-12 days	\$6.54
328	DUST MOP PAD 48" x 5" Washable Hospital Grade, Blue 4-ply yarn	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte DM- 81548	7-12 days	\$8.34
329	EAR PLUG CORDED, NON WASHABLE (Equal To MMM1110)	Box = 100 PAIR	Pyramid School Products	IMPACT #7311C (10 BX/CS)	10-14 DAYS	\$26.95
335	MOP HEAD, 16 Oz COTTON	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte MH- 10016	7-12 days	\$1.64
336	MOP HEAD, 24 Oz COTTON	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte MH- 10024	7-12 days	\$2.41
337	MOP HEAD, 16 Oz RAYON BLEND	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte MH- 67016	7-12 days	\$4.12
338	MOP HEAD, 24 Oz RAYON BLEND	EACH	Athens Janitor	Lafitte MH- 37022	7-12 days	\$5.35
341	TOWEL, BLUE HUCK HOSPECO 539-25 (No Substitutions)	25lb/Box	CCP Industries	As Spec	2-3 Days	\$37.50
342	RAGS, WHITE TERRY 537-25 Hospital Specialty (No Substitutions)	25lb/Box	CCP Industries	As Spec	2-3 Days	\$33.12
343	LATEX GLOVES, SMALL LIGHTLY POWDERED	100/Box	Calico Industries	Safety Zone GRDR-Sample Sent	7-10 Day Aro	\$2.98

344	LATEX GLOVES, MEDIUM LIGHTLY POWDERED	100/Box	Calico Industries	Safety Zone GRDR-Sample Sent	7-10 Day Aro	\$2.98
345	LATEX GLOVES, LARGE LIGHTLY POWDERED	100/Box	Calico Industries	Safety Zone GRDR-Sample Sent	7-10 Day Aro	\$2.98
346	LATEX GLOVES, X-LARGE LIGHTLY POWDERED	100/Box	Calico Industries	Safety Zone GRDR-Sample Sent	7-10 Day Aro	\$2.98
347	SANISAC, WAXED DISPOSABLE BAGS	500/Box	Pyramid School Products	HOSPECO #KL260	10-14 DAYS	\$11.98
348	SAFETY SCRAPER, REPLACEMENT BLADES Equal to #PHCRB009	100/Box	Veritiv	IMPACT 3401	12-14 ARO	\$3.75
356	VACUUM BAGS, 10/pk. (ProPak #100331 only)	10/CASE	Athens Janitor	ProTeam 84301	7-12 days	\$11.00
358	Scraper Blade 4" Equal To Unger RB10C	10/CASE	Pyramid School Products	CONTINENTA L #2557P	10-14 DAYS	\$3.56
501	AJAX/COMET (21 oz container, 24 per case)	24/CASE	Pyramid School Products	BABO #P752088	10-14 DAYS	\$21.35
502	BLEACH (4 GAL/CASE)	4/CASE	Veritiv	AUSTIN 360 GL 6/CS	12-14 ARO	\$8.73
503	FLOOR STRIPPER 23 oz Cans (Equal to Renown 05022)	12/CASE	Interline Brands	Renown - REN05022-AM	Next Day	\$42.72

507	FIELD PAINT, AEROSOL WHITE (18 oz cans) Equal to Sherwin Williams Sherstripe	12/CASE	Pyramid School Products	SHERWIN WILLIAMS (KRYLON) #K08305	10-14 DAYS	\$36.98
525	Anti-Foam / Defoamer Gallon Size	4GL/CASE	Athens Janitor	AJS #02623	7-12 days	\$19.05
514	OIL DRY, ALL PURPOSE ABSORBENT	50 lb/BAG	Athens Janitor	AJS 63161	7-12 days	\$4.99
521	DISINFECTANT CLEANER 32 OZ (Equal to SaniClean 189902)	12/CASE	Non Award	Non Award	Non Award	Non Award
526	Bacteria Deodorant Gallon Size (Equal To Consume #3097-04)	4GL/CASE	Athens Janitor	Spartan - SPA3097-04	Next Day	\$43.24
166	Poly Brush Disk 13" Tennant #1014346 (No Substitutions)	EACH	Grainger	4vix8 exact	2-3 days	\$102.06
535	Multipurpose Cleaner & Polish Hillyard MCP #0106054 (No Substitutions)	12/CASE	Athens Janitor	Hillyard M/P #10605	7-12 days	\$52.97