

P16-13, Fire Services Cost Tabsheet	Cliffs Fire						Atlanta Sprinkler						Tyco/Simplex Grinnell						AFA Southeast								
	Annual Fire (5.2.4)	Annual Sprinkler and Hydrant (5.2.5)	Annual Fire Extinguisher (5.2.6)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (1st Insp) (5.2.7)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (2nd Insp) (5.2.7)	Total	Annual Fire (5.2.4)	Annual Sprinkler and Hydrant (5.2.5)	Annual Fire Extinguisher (5.2.6)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (1st Insp) (5.2.7)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (2nd Insp) (5.2.7)	Total	Annual Fire (5.2.4)	Annual Sprinkler and Hydrant (5.2.5)	Annual Fire Extinguisher (5.2.6)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (1st Insp) (5.2.7)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (2nd Insp) (5.2.7)	Total	Annual Fire (5.2.4)	Annual Sprinkler and Hydrant (5.2.5)	Annual Fire Extinguisher (5.2.6)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (1st Insp) (5.2.7)	Semi-Annual Kitchen (2nd Insp) (5.2.7)	Total			
Piedmont Learning Center	\$235.00	\$280.00	\$110.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$835.00	\$577.00	\$450.00	\$184.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,481.00	\$400.00	\$1,035.00	\$365.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,050.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Big Creek ES	\$275.00	\$365.00	\$220.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,070.00	\$759.00	\$530.00	\$280.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,839.00	\$550.00	\$990.00	\$545.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,335.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Brookwood ES	\$390.00	\$405.00	\$200.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,285.00	\$856.00	\$450.00	\$304.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,150.00	\$630.00	\$1,035.00	\$590.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,755.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Chattahoochee ES	\$390.00	\$405.00	\$200.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,285.00	\$614.00	\$450.00	\$336.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,670.00	\$430.00	\$1,035.00	\$650.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,365.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Chesatee ES	\$860.00	\$405.00	\$255.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,730.00	\$989.00	\$450.00	\$392.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$2,101.00	\$740.00	\$1,035.00	\$755.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,780.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Coal Mountain ES	\$430.00	\$315.00	\$180.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,135.00	\$662.00	\$375.00	\$200.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,507.00	\$470.00	\$820.00	\$395.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$1,935.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Cumming ES	\$745.00	\$405.00	\$365.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,805.00	\$820.00	\$450.00	\$400.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,250.00	\$600.00	\$1,035.00	\$845.00	\$270.00	\$250.00	\$2,980.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Daves Creek ES	\$275.00	\$350.00	\$170.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,005.00	\$469.00	\$400.00	\$304.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,443.00	\$310.00	\$950.00	\$590.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,100.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Forsyth Central HS	\$900.00	\$870.00	\$685.00	\$595.00	\$595.00	\$3,645.00	\$1,836.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,024.00	\$1,890.00	\$1,890.00	\$7,640.00	\$1,440.00	\$2,370.00	\$1,960.00	\$1,750.00	\$1,750.00	\$9,270.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Haw Creek ES	\$1,060.00	\$440.00	\$395.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$2,185.00	\$1,800.00	\$450.00	\$496.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,286.00	\$1,410.00	\$1,035.00	\$1,010.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,955.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Johns Creek ES	\$585.00	\$350.00	\$295.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,520.00	\$1,824.00	\$375.00	\$480.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,219.00	\$1,430.00	\$820.00	\$940.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,690.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Kelly Mill ES	\$585.00	\$400.00	\$190.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,465.00	\$830.00	\$475.00	\$296.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,141.00	\$660.00	\$1,295.00	\$575.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,030.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Lakeside MS	\$1,295.00	\$595.00	\$350.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$2,530.00	\$1,981.00	\$600.00	\$544.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,665.00	\$1,560.00	\$1,640.00	\$1,080.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$4,780.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Lambert HS	\$2,235.00	\$750.00	\$575.00	\$525.00	\$525.00	\$4,610.00	\$6,518.00	\$800.00	\$952.00	\$1,485.00	\$1,485.00	\$11,240.00	\$5,310.00	\$2,115.00	\$1,825.00	\$1,375.00	\$1,375.00	\$12,000.00	\$2,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Liberty MS	\$430.00	\$440.00	\$240.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,400.00	\$1,219.00	\$375.00	\$384.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,518.00	\$680.00	\$775.00	\$740.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,695.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Little Mill MS	\$1,060.00	\$475.00	\$310.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$2,135.00	\$2,223.00	\$400.00	\$560.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,723.00	\$1,760.00	\$1,295.00	\$1,070.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$4,625.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Mashburn ES	\$585.00	\$315.00	\$125.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,235.00	\$1,558.00	\$375.00	\$200.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$2,403.00	\$1,210.00	\$820.00	\$395.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,675.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Matt ES	\$745.00	\$440.00	\$230.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,705.00	\$1,715.00	\$475.00	\$352.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,082.00	\$1,380.00	\$1,295.00	\$680.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,855.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Midway ES	\$390.00	\$315.00	\$150.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,065.00	\$686.00	\$375.00	\$256.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,587.00	\$490.00	\$820.00	\$500.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,060.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
North Forsyth HS	\$745.00	\$785.00	\$525.00	\$455.00	\$455.00	\$2,965.00	\$1,654.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,080.00	\$945.00	\$945.00	\$5,624.00	\$1,290.00	\$2,370.00	\$2,045.00	\$875.00	\$875.00	\$7,455.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
North Forsyth MS	\$275.00	\$405.00	\$335.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$1,415.00	\$1,049.00	\$400.00	\$528.00	\$405.00	\$405.00	\$2,787.00	\$790.00	\$1,165.00	\$1,010.00	\$375.00	\$375.00	\$3,715.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Otwell MS	\$825.00	\$475.00	\$300.00	\$230.00	\$230.00	\$2,060.00	\$1,715.00	\$400.00	\$536.00	\$675.00	\$675.00	\$4,001.00	\$1,340.00	\$1,295.00	\$1,025.00	\$625.00	\$625.00	\$4,910.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Piney Grove MS	\$1,060.00	\$440.00	\$255.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$2,045.00	\$2,320.00	\$400.00	\$456.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,716.00	\$1,840.00	\$1,165.00	\$875.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$4,380.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Riverwatch MS	\$310.00	\$440.00	\$360.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,400.00	\$759.00	\$400.00	\$584.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,283.00	\$550.00	\$1,165.00	\$1,135.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,350.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Sawnee ES (Both Campus)	\$705.00	\$670.00	\$415.00	\$255.00	\$255.00	\$2,300.00	\$1,203.00	\$750.00	\$544.00	\$405.00	\$405.00	\$3,307.00	\$840.00	\$1,640.00	\$530.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$3,260.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Settles Bridge ES	\$550.00	\$440.00	\$165.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,365.00	\$1,582.00	\$450.00	\$216.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$2,518.00	\$1,230.00	\$1,035.00	\$425.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$2,940.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Sharon ES	\$550.00	\$405.00	\$315.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,560.00	\$1,376.00	\$400.00	\$488.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,804.00	\$1,060.00	\$905.00	\$935.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,400.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Shiloh Point ES	\$785.00	\$315.00	\$330.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,720.00	\$1,545.00	\$375.00	\$488.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,948.00	\$1,200.00	\$820.00	\$955.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,475.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Silver City ES	\$585.00	\$405.00	\$175.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,455.00	\$820.00	\$450.00	\$272.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$2,082.00	\$600.00	\$1,035.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,635.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
South Forsyth HS	\$980.00	\$1,010.00	\$855.00	\$480.00	\$480.00	\$3,805.00	\$1,703.00	\$1,100.00	\$1,040.00	\$1,215.00	\$1,215.00	\$6,273.00	\$1,330.00	\$2,760.00	\$2,030.00	\$1,125.00	\$1,125.00	\$8,370.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
South Forsyth MS	\$430.00	\$610.00	\$275.00	\$235.00	\$235.00	\$1,785.00	\$1,280.00	\$1,250.00	\$400.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,470.00	\$980.00	\$1,080.00	\$770.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,330.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Vickery Creek ES	\$550.00	\$595.00	\$240.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$1,595.00	\$1,412.00	\$600.00	\$336.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$2,618.00	\$1,170.00	\$1,640.00	\$650.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$3,710.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Vickery Creek MS	\$430.00	\$610.00	\$315.00	\$175.00	\$175.00	\$1,705.00	\$1,219.00	\$1,210.00	\$344.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$3,313.00	\$1,010.00	\$950.00	\$665.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$3,125.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
West Forsyth HS	\$2,235.00	\$825.00	\$575.00	\$430.00	\$430.00	\$4,495.00	\$6,519.00	\$800.00	\$936.00	\$1,485.00	\$1,485.00	\$11,225.00	\$5,480.00	\$2,245.00	\$1,795.00	\$1,375.00	\$1,375.00	\$12,270.00	\$2,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Whitlow ES	\$585.00	\$405.00	\$190.00	\$145.00	\$145.00	\$1,470.00	\$844.00	\$450.00	\$264.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,828.00	\$620.00	\$1,035.00	\$515.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,670.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Hill Center	\$235.00	\$230.00	\$80.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$545.00	\$590.00	\$375.00	\$144.00	\$270.00	\$270.00	\$1,649.00	\$410.00	\$820.00	\$270.00	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,000.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Warehouse and Maintenance (Both)	\$275.00	\$0.00	\$225.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$500.00	\$1,639.00	\$0.00	\$312.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$1,951.00	\$340.00	\$0.00	\$585.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$925.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
Professional Development Center (PDC)	\$430.00	\$180.00	\$120.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$810.00	\$1,134.00	\$240.00	\$160.00	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$1,804.00	\$345.00	\$860.00	\$300.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$1,755.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
North Transportation	\$235.00	\$195.00	\$65.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$495.00	\$190.00	\$350.00	\$80.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$620.00	\$80.00	\$260.00	\$170.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$510.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
South Transportation (Lambert)	\$235.00	\$100.00	\$65.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$400.00	\$529.00	\$50.00	\$16.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$595.00	\$360.00	\$130.00	\$30.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$520.00	\$550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid			
<b>TOTAL</b>						<b>\$69,535.00</b>							<b>\$126,361.00</b>							<b>\$150,640.00</b>							<b>\$42,900.00</b>
Re-Inspection Cost per Hour (per Addendum 1)				\$50.00								\$85.00								\$136.50							

**COST POINTS - RFP P16-13, FIRE SERVICES**

<b>P16-13, Fire Services Cost Summary</b>	<b>Cliffs Fire</b>	<b>Atlanta Sprinkler</b>	<b>Tyco/Simplex</b>	<b>AFA</b>
<b>Fires Services As Specified Points Available: 80</b>	<b>\$69,535.00</b>	<b>\$126,361.00</b>	<b>\$150,640.00</b>	<b>No Responsive Did Not Bid 5.2.5, 5.2.6 or 5.2.7</b>
<b>Re-Inspection Cost Per Hour</b>	<b>\$50.00</b>	<b>\$85.00</b>	<b>\$136.50</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>Cost Points</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>44</b>	<b>37</b>	<b>N/A</b>

P16-13, Non-Cost Specifications Max Points Available: 20		Cliffs Fire		Atlanta Sprinkler		Tyco/Simplex		AFA
Criteria / Points Available	Points		Points		Points		Points	
<b>Contract Requirements Section 5.0 Special Terms &amp; Conditions, Vendor Questionnaire, References &amp; Value Add</b> <b>Points Available: 15</b>	15	100% Excellent	10.5	70% - Scope of work submitted was not tailored to the FCS scope of work in 5.0.	15	100% Excellent	N/A	Non- Responsive - Did not include written scope of work.
<b>Vendor Questionnaire &amp; References</b> <b>Points Available: 5</b>	4.5	90% Very Good - Missing one reference response.	5	100% Excellent	4.5	90% Very Good - Missing one reference response.	N/A	Non- Responsive - Did not include written scope of work.
<b>Notes: Non-Cost Determined Utilizing Scoring Matrix Relative to Points Available:</b> Excellent=100%, Very Good= 90%, Good=80%, Adequate=70%, Marginal=60%, Poor=25%, Unacceptable=0%	19.5		15.5		19.5		N/A	

<b>FINAL SUMMARY - RFP P16-13 ,Fire Services</b>				
<b>RFP P16-13 Fire Services</b>	<b>Cliffs Fire</b>	<b>Tyco/Simplex</b>	<b>Atlanta Sprinkler</b>	<b>AFA</b>
<b>Non- Cost Points (20 Available)</b>	<b>19.5</b>	<b>19.5</b>	<b>15.5</b>	<b>Vendor is non responsive for not providing a scope of work.</b>
<b>Cost Points (80 Available)</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>37</b>	<b>44</b>	<b>Vendor is non responsive for not providing pricing in for sections 5.2.5, 5.2.6 or 5.2.7</b>
<b>Total</b>	<b>99.5</b>	<b>56.5</b>	<b>59.5</b>	<b>N/A</b>